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Preparing individuals for the responsibilities associated with manag-
ing human resources in today’s rapidly changing hospitality industry 
is critical to their success and the long-term success of the industry 
as a whole. Achieving this goal is not easy when teaching any subject 
today is challenging because the student is accustomed to information 
coming in compressed pieces accompanied by rapid feedback. I have 
developed this textbook to meet these challenges. The information it 
contains is current and also presents potential areas of change. The 
textbook addresses the processes, procedures, and laws, as well as, the 
impact of environment and attitudes on building the individual and the 
team to achieve desired outcomes. The content is presented in seg-
ments that allow the student to concentrate on one area of knowledge 
at a time. The support materials provided make it possible to constantly 
reinforce what the students read in the chapter and measure their com-
prehension with rapid feedback on their success.

	 This textbook and the supporting materials were piloted with over 
600 students. The students provided a high level of comment on the 
materials that contributed greatly to the final materials provided in this 
work particularly in the area of clarity of information, test questions, 
and case content. The textbook is designed for use in a lecture, hybrid, 
or fully online course format. It has been successfully used with an 
online learning platform in a hybrid course format.

	 This textbook is designed for today’s student. It is focused on the 
subject matter with no addition of ancillary material such as opinion or 
industry leader pieces. It is left to the teacher to enrich their course with 
those types of information. The students involved in the pilot found 
this format both functional and effective. The students who complete 
this textbook will have a solid knowledge of the management of human 
resources in the hospitality industry.

—Jerald Chesser, EdD, CEC, FMP, CCE, AAC
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